9x12 Envelopes
Bidder Cost/Box of 500
Virgin Content

Bodree Printing Company $121.16
Diux Printing $154.06
Formsystems $103.00
Franklins Printing $99.34
GCOP $72.50
Livingston Business Forms No Bid
National Imprint Corporation No Bid
Office Depot* $133.19
Officepointe No Bid
PRIDE Enterprises $70.65
TMT Printing $92.12
Top Flight No Bid

Recommend Award: PRIDE Enterprises

RFQ P12, 2010/2011 Tabulation
Printing of Catalog Envelopes
9%12 10x13

9x12 Envelopes 10x13 Envelopes 10x13 Envelopes
Cost/Box of 500 Cost/Box of 500 Cost/Box of 500
Recycled Content Virgin Content Recycled Content
N/A $126.89 N/A
$85.15 $221.31 $118.48
No Bid $119.00 No Bid
No Bid $103.84 No Bid
N/A $85.00 N/A
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$182.37 $140.56 $198.86
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid $65.85 No Bid
$101.34 $118.22 $130.05
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Days (Business)

5-7 working days

5 business days from proof approval
7-9 business days

5 business days

not indicated

7 days after proof approval

7 days after proof approval

5-7 business days

*Office Depot's offer is based on Pensacola State College acceptance of Office Depot's Terms & Conditions attached to their quote.

et 0 Orves

Angie %}Jones, Directcfy Purchasing
and Auxillary Services




